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'There is a particular propensity for apnea [slow breathing] when even very small doses of midazolam are given in conjunction
with fentanyl,' write emergency medicine experts Reichman and Simon.. < Talk:Amy Winehouse

Amy Winehouse Death Photo DeadAmy Winehouse Autopsy ResultsAmy Winehouse Autopsy PhotoAmy Winehouse Cause
Of DeathAmy Winehouse Crime SceneSummary of Autopsy Report for Diana, Princess of WalesOn August 30, 2007, CBS
Evening News obtained a copy of Spencers 40-page autopsy report and ran a television piece titled, 'Was there time to save
Diana? New revelations on the 10th anniversary of Princess death raise questions'.. The SAMU team spent about 30 more
minutes (around 12:50 am [after the cardiac arrest] to 1:19 am) tending to Diana in the tunnel.
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Stanley Zydlo, MD, a prominent American emergency physician from Northern Illinois and pioneer in pre-hospital trauma
systems dating to their origin in the late 1960s and early 1970s, said in an interview with a CBS reporter that at least 70 minutes
were lost in the field during Diana, Princess of Wales prehospital care.. This effect is more likely to occur in hypovolemic [low
blood volume inside the circulatory system from, say, internal hemorrhage or dehydration] patients or elderly patients',
Reichman and Simon note with caution.. The medical dispatcher called the hospital to assess for ICU bed availability, which
was normal procedure.. The French SAMU physician said in a deposition that Diana, Princess of Wales was crying out. 
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 There apparently was no appreciation for the seriousness of her internal blunt injuries.. The first witnesses on the scene found
her sitting on the floor of the back seat with eyes open and mumbling indistinct phrases.. At 1:19 am, the SAMU team contacted
the SAMU de Paris medical dispatcher to request permission to take her to a hospital four miles away.. Personnel with Sapeurs-
Pompiers, a military firefighting service run by the civil defense component of the French Ministry of the Interior, apparently
arrived within seven minutes of the crash (12:32 am) and began administering treatment. Mac Os X Lion Install Dvd Download
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When he could not reassure her, he started an intravenous drip in her arm and at 12:45 am infused intravenous midazolam
(Versed) and fentanyl, an opioid analgesic 80 times more potent than morphine, to 'calm her down'.. He performed endotracheal
intubation [inserted a tube into her windpipe to open and maintain her airway], placed her on a respirator [to ventilate her lungs
with oxygen through the tube in her windpipe], and performed external cardiac massage to reestablish her cardiac rhythm.. In
Diana's case, the bleeding was from a torn pulmonary vein in her chest Diana was a 36-year-old unrestrained (no seatbelt)
female back-seat Mercedes automobile occupant in a motor vehicle accident who sustained blunt chest and probably head
trauma at 12:25 am on August 31, 1997.. After administering the drugs and beginning to extract the patient from the car, the
SAMU physician noted that Diana went into cardiac arrest [her heart stopped beating].. When a patient has unstable vital signs
(blood pressure, pulse, respirations) following multiple trauma, rapid transport to a surgeon in a hospital is imperative to find
and stop the source of haemorrage, he said.. The first physician on the scene,a physician with the private medical service SOS
Medecins, called the SAMU de Paris switchboard operator, which is the normal routine.. Fifteen minutes after the motor
vehicle crash (12:40 am), the first SAMU medical intensive care unit (MICU) arrived with its on board physician, probably an
anesthesiologist but possibly an anesthesiologist-designated/trained general practitioner. cea114251b Logmein Rescue Mac
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